

Bid List for: Chemical Purchase

Opened: 12-19-16

11/3

Organization	Price	Notes
1 Chemrite, Inc.	1 no bid 2 no bid 3 1.88/lb 4 no bid 5 no bid	Dufford, Georgia
2 Univar USA, Inc.	1 1.8754 per lb 2 N/B 3 4.20 per lb 4 1.508 per lb 5 1.85 per lb	Providence, RI
3 Astro Chemicals, Inc.	1 N/B 2 1.205 per lb 3 1.795 per lb 4 N/B 5 N/B	Spencer, MA
4 Borden & Remington Corp.	1 1.7425 per lb 2 N/B 3 1.8596 per lb 4 1.9019 per lb 5 N/B	Free News, MA
5 Harcross Chemicals	1 1.7300 per lb 2 N/B 3 1.85 per lb 4 1.0449 per lb 5 N/B	Woburn, MA
6 PVS Technologies, Inc.	1 N/B 2 N/B 3 N/B 4 N/B 5 1.31 per lb	Detroit, Michigan
7 Holland Company	1 N/B 2 N/B 3 N/B 4 N/B 5 1.80 per lb	Obvious, MA
8 Shannon Chemical	1 N/B 2 N/B 3 1.844 per lb 4 N/B 5 N/B	Melrose, PA
9 JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	1 N/B 2 N/B 3 N/B 4 N/B 5 1.34 per lb	Scranton, PA
10 George S. Coyne Chemicals Co.	1 N/B 2 1.1404 per lb 3 1.7784 per lb 4 N/B 5 N/B	Chickadee, PA
11 Southern Ionics Incorporated	1 N/B 2 N/B 3 N/B 4 N/B 5 1.52 per lb	West Pt, Mississippi