

Bid List for: Chemical Purchase

Opened: 12-4-2017

Organization	Price	Notes	NB = No Bid
1 Borden & Remington Corp.	1. 28 .8392/lb 2. \emptyset NO BID 3. \$1.923/lb	4. \$1.1627 5. \emptyset NO BID	
2 Chemrite, Inc.	1. \emptyset N 2. \emptyset No Bid 3. \$1.775/lb	4. No BID 5. No BID	
3 George S. Coyne Chemicals Co.	1. NB 2. \$1.1987/lb 3. \$1.7763/lb	4. NB 5. NB	
4 Harcros Chemicals	1. .7995/gal 2. NB 3. 1.73/lb	4. \$1.2067/gal 5. NB	
5 Holland Company	1. NB 2. NB 3. NB	4. NB 5. \$1.80/gal	
6 JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc.	1. NB 2. NB 3. NB	4. NB 5. \$1.45/gal	
7 PVS Technologies, Inc.	1. NB 2. NB 3. NB	4. NB 5. \$1.40/gal	
8 Shannon Chemical	1. NB 2. NB 3. 1.69/lb	4. NB 5. NB	
9 Thatcher Company	1. NB 2. \$1.128/lb 3. \$1.789/lb	4. NB 5. NB	
10 Univar	1. \$1.05/ 2. NB 3. \$1.989	4. \$1.177 5. \$1.90	

W3-VK 129

P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.
P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.
P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.	P. W. G.

W3-VK 129